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Kartell Tea Table Lamp
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PRODUCT DESCRIPTION

Designer: Ferruccio Laviani

Kartell Tea Table Lamp

Designed by Ferruccio Laviani for Kartell, the Tea Table Lamp
consists of an abstract shaped shade, that seems to resemble
two hands holding the light source in their palms. Thanks to the
innovative and irregular texture on the two shades, the Tea
creates beautiful shadows that project across its surroundings.
The light emission that is produced by this lamp is a warm glow,
guaranteed to provide functionality but also create a calming
environment. This makes the Kartell Tea Table Lamp perfect for
living areas, bedrooms, coffee tables and in public spaces such
as restaurants and hotels. Tea by Kartell is available in a range of
natural colours, ensuring that this table lamp can not only blend
into any interior, but enhance it.

The Tea lamp is made of recycled thermoplastic techno polymer,
although it appears to be crafted from ceramic. With this table
lamp, Laviani proves that it is possible to utilise modern day
materials to achieve a natural and fragile look - just like more
classic and delicate materials such as glass or ceramics. This
results in the Tea lamp not only being durable and authentic, but
also eco friendly. A perfect combination of functionality and
sustainability.

Please Note: this table lamp comes with a cable and plug so
must be placed near a socket.

PRODUCT SPECIFICATION

Light Source: 1 x Max 5W E14 LED (included)

IP Code: 20

Dimensions: Height: 32.5cm
Width: 28cm
Depth: 21cm
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